
True or False... III Bible Quiz

Abraham lived for more than 900 years1:

True
False

Jesus was tempted to turn stones into
bread

2:

True
False

Aaron died on Mount Nebo3:

True
False

Jesus used two loaves and five fishes to
feed the 4,000

4:

True
False

Jesus healed the lame man at the
temple's Beautiful Gate

5:

True
False

Jeremiah was the son of Hilkiah6:

True
False

Daniel interpreted a dream for King
Nebuchadnezzar

7:

True
False

Haman's ten sons were hanged at
Esther's request

8:

True
False

Simon of Samaria helped carry the cross
of Jesus

9:

True
False

Zacchaeus lived in Capernaum10:

True
False
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True or False... III Bible Quiz

Five of the lepers Jesus healed came
back to thank him

11:

True
False

Cain fled to the Land of Nod12:

True
False

God asked Moses to make two silver
trumpets for calling the Israelites
together

13:

True
False

The Queen of Sheba tested King David
with hard questions

14:

True
False

God formed man from the dust of the
earth

15:

True
False

Genesis is the first book of the Bible16:

True
False

In Revelation, John saw four chariots
being pulled by horses

17:

True
False

Peter cut off the ear of Malachi18:

True
False

The Israelites were permitted to eat
lizards

19:

True
False

A tent peg was used to kill the captain of
the Canaanite army

20:

True
False
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God rested on the 8th day of creation21:

True
False

Elijah raised the daughter of a widow22:

True
False

Achan was stoned for stealing treasures
from Ai which were devoted to God

23:

True
False

King Zimri reigned for only seven days
before killing himself

24:

True
False

Elisha had long hair that reached his
waist

25:

True
False

The Israelites danced before the golden
calf Aaron made

26:

True
False

Uzzah was killed for touching the Ark of
God

27:

True
False

Naomi asked to be called by a different
name

28:

True
False

King Solomon brought back apes from
Tarshish

29:

True
False

Joseph and Mary went to Jerusalem
every year for the Feast of Passover

30:

True
False
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Jesus was raised on the 4th day after his
death

31:

True
False

Nicodemus came to see Jesus at night32:

True
False

Gomorrah was destroyed by fire and
brimstone

33:

True
False

Gehazi was Elisha's brother34:

True
False

Ants are mentioned in the book of
Proverbs

35:

True
False

The seven headed dragon in Revelation
was green

36:

True
False

Jesus was called a drunkard37:

True
False

Noah closed the door of the ark38:

True
False

Proverbs speaks of life as a "chasing
after the wind"

39:

True
False

Bathsheba was David's first wife40:

True
False
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The apostles were filled with the Holy
Spirit at Pentecost

41:

True
False

A cloud rested over the tabernacle during
the day

42:

True
False

The 9th plague on Egypt was darkness43:

True
False

Absalom had his hair cut once a year44:

True
False

Jesus was made to wear a green robe45:

True
False

18 people where killed by the Tower of
Zion falling on them

46:

True
False

Jesus was brought before Annas47:

True
False

Solomon was also given the name
Jedidiah at birth

48:

True
False

The wicked are likened to a deaf camel49:

True
False

Jesus visited the temple when he was 12
years old

50:

True
False
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Bible Trivia Quizzes by bibletrivia.co.uk

Thank you for downloading and using our Bible quizzes. We hope that you have found them both enjoyable and

enlightening. Our Bible quizzes are designed to enhance your knowledge of the scriptures, spark curiosity, and provide

an engaging way to learn and reflect on biblical teachings. Whether you are using these quizzes for personal study, in

a classroom setting, or as a fun activity for a church event, we believe they offer a meaningful way to connect with

God's word.

The Benefits of Bible Quizzes
Enhance memory retention of important biblical facts and stories.

Encourage group participation and discussion in a fun and interactive manner.

Serve as an effective teaching tool in Sunday schools, Bible study groups, and religious education classes.

Provide a thoughtful and reflective activity for personal spiritual growth.

Foster a sense of community and shared learning when used in group settings.

Various Uses of Our Bible Quizzes
Church Events: Engage your congregation with a fun and educational activity.

Family Gatherings: Bring generations together with a quiz that all ages can enjoy.

Youth Groups: Offer a dynamic and interactive way for young people to learn about the Bible.

Classroom Settings: Use as a teaching aid in religious education classes.

Personal Study: Challenge yourself and track your progress in understanding the Bible.

Answers
To preserve the integrity of our statistical data, answers are available once you have completed the online version of

the Bible Quiz where you can also request to have the answers e-mailed to you. This ensures that the quiz remains a

fair and effective tool for learning and self-assessment.

Stay Connected
We invite you to stay connected with us:

Visit our website for more quizzes, puzzles, and resources.

Follow us on social media for the latest updates and new quizzes.

Join our newsletter to receive exclusive content and special offers.

Feedback and Testimonials
We value your feedback! If you have any suggestions, comments, or testimonials about how our quizzes have

benefited you or your group, please share them with us. Your input helps us improve and provide the best possible

resources for your spiritual journey.

Support Us
If you find our resources helpful, consider supporting us by:

Sharing our website with friends, family, and your church community.

Making a small donation to help us continue providing quality content.

Suggesting new quizzes or content ideas.

Copyright
All material is copyright of the Bible Trivia site and may be freely used in non-profit publications as long as

bibletrivia.co.uk is credited as the source. Any other use, including commercial use or online publication, requires

written permission.

Thank you once again for choosing BibleTrivia.co.uk. We hope our quizzes bring joy, knowledge, and spiritual growth to

you and your community. God bless!
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