
Towns & Cities Bible Quiz

Which of these cities was not part of
Nimrod's kingdom?

1:

Babel
Erech
Haran
Accad

In which city did Abraham originally live
before moving to Canaan?

2:

Ur
Hebron
Damascus
Haran

Which of these cities was not a city of
refuge?

3:

Golan
Hebron
Jericho
Kedesh

In which city was Samson imprisoned
before his death?

4:

Gezer
Gaza
Aphek
Ashkelon

In which city did Saul consult a witch
(medium)?

5:

Megiddo
Shechem
Dan
Endor

When the ark was captured, where was it
not taken to?

6:

Ashdod
Ekron
Beersheba
Gath

Which city was Goliath from?7:

Endor
Ziklag
Kiriath Jearim
Gath

Which city was Hiram king of?8:

Hazor
Tyre
Megiddo
Sidon

Where did the prophet Jonah go to find a
ship to Tarshish?

9:

Joppa
Dor
Nineveh
Zarephath

Which city's name means "House of
God"?

10:

Gilgal
Bethlehem
Bethel
Hebron
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Towns & Cities Bible Quiz

After Jesus called Simon and Andrew to
follow him, which town's synagogue did
they go into?

11:

Capernaum
Nazareth
Cana
Gennesaret

Where was the wedding held that Jesus
attended?

12:

Caesarea
Jerusalem
Cana
Sychar

After feeding the 5,000, where did Jesus
send his disciples to?

13:

Magadan
Bethsaida
Tyre
Nain

Where was Lazarus raised from the
dead?

14:

Jericho
Bethany
Emmaus
Bethphage

Where did Jesus meet Zacchaeus?15:

Azotus
Jericho
Bethlehem
Gadara

Where was the apostle Paul (Saul) from?16:

Damascus
Corinth
Antioch
Tarsus

The Jews in which city were described as
receiving the word with all readiness of
mind and searching the scriptures daily?

17:

Apollonia
Troas
Berea
Neapolis

In which city did Paul encounter
worshippers of Diana (Artemis)?

18:

Athens
Thessalonica
Philippi
Ephesus

Where did Paul go to appeal to Caesar?19:

Rome
Caesarea
Syracuse
Three Taverns

The believers in which city were
described in Revelation as being
"lukewarm"?

20:

Sardis
Philadelphia
Laodicea
Smyrna
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Thank you for downloading and using our Bible quizzes. We hope that you have found them both enjoyable and

enlightening. Our Bible quizzes are designed to enhance your knowledge of the scriptures, spark curiosity, and provide

an engaging way to learn and reflect on biblical teachings. Whether you are using these quizzes for personal study, in

a classroom setting, or as a fun activity for a church event, we believe they offer a meaningful way to connect with

God's word.

The Benefits of Bible Quizzes
Enhance memory retention of important biblical facts and stories.

Encourage group participation and discussion in a fun and interactive manner.

Serve as an effective teaching tool in Sunday schools, Bible study groups, and religious education classes.

Provide a thoughtful and reflective activity for personal spiritual growth.

Foster a sense of community and shared learning when used in group settings.

Various Uses of Our Bible Quizzes
Church Events: Engage your congregation with a fun and educational activity.

Family Gatherings: Bring generations together with a quiz that all ages can enjoy.

Youth Groups: Offer a dynamic and interactive way for young people to learn about the Bible.

Classroom Settings: Use as a teaching aid in religious education classes.

Personal Study: Challenge yourself and track your progress in understanding the Bible.

Answers
To preserve the integrity of our statistical data, answers are available once you have completed the online version of

the Bible Quiz where you can also request to have the answers e-mailed to you. This ensures that the quiz remains a

fair and effective tool for learning and self-assessment.

Stay Connected
We invite you to stay connected with us:

Visit our website for more quizzes, puzzles, and resources.

Follow us on social media for the latest updates and new quizzes.

Join our newsletter to receive exclusive content and special offers.

Feedback and Testimonials
We value your feedback! If you have any suggestions, comments, or testimonials about how our quizzes have

benefited you or your group, please share them with us. Your input helps us improve and provide the best possible

resources for your spiritual journey.

Support Us
If you find our resources helpful, consider supporting us by:

Sharing our website with friends, family, and your church community.

Making a small donation to help us continue providing quality content.

Suggesting new quizzes or content ideas.

Copyright
All material is copyright of the Bible Trivia site and may be freely used in non-profit publications as long as

bibletrivia.co.uk is credited as the source. Any other use, including commercial use or online publication, requires

written permission.

Thank you once again for choosing BibleTrivia.co.uk. We hope our quizzes bring joy, knowledge, and spiritual growth to

you and your community. God bless!
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